Town of Old Lyme

Hains Park Boathouse

Bid Opening 21 Jun 16

Alternates
Bidder Bid No. 1 No. 2 No. 3 No.4
HardiePanel Clopay Door Monterey Turf
Banton Construction $938,000.00 $35,000.00 -$16,000.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00
Carlin Construction NO BID
Commercial Construction Group $609,600.00 $27,187.00 $6,500.00 $6,300.00 $33,000.00
G. Donovan Associates $677,000.00 -$10,000.00 $8,000.00 $3,000.00 $10,500.00
Kronenberger & Sons Restoration NO BID
Mattern Construction NO BID
Newbury Construction NO BID
Noble Construction NO BID
Nosal Builders $783,454.00 $14,500.00 -$30,000.00 $1,190.00 $9,560.00
Old Colony Construction NO BID
Orlando Annulli & Sons $874,200.00 $1,900.00 -$41,500.00 $850.00 $18,850.00
OWI Construction NO BID
Pazz Construction NO BID
Rudolph Netsch Construction NO BID
Sarazin General Contractors $737,000.00 -$26,000.00 -$23,600.00 $8,700.00 $18,000.00
Scope Construction $587,000.00 $6,000.00 -$22,000.00 $700.00 $4,800.00




